
The Hokendauqua Park and Playground Association (HPPA) 

Bob Warke - Dale Horn Scholarship - 2024 

Bob Warke and Dale Horn were the heart and soul of Hokendauqua youth sports. Their 
participation spanned four decades and their first concern was always the development of the 
children. The HPPA Bob Warke – Dale Horn Scholarship is a testimonial in recognition to their 
lifelong dedication to the association and the youth of the area.  

Each year, the HPPA will award two $1,000 scholarships in Bob Warke & Dale Horn’s memory to 
one girl and one boy who has met the eligibility requirements, been evaluated by the scholarship 
criteria, will graduate from high school within the current fiscal year and will continue their 
education at a university, college or trade school in the fall.  

Eligibility  

Eligibility for the scholarship requires that the applicant must have participated in a HPPA athletic 
program for at least two years and completed their 8th grade eligibility. If an applicant participated 
in the HPPA’s Baseball, Softball or Basketball programs for two years and then played on a high 
school freshman sports team when they were in 8th grade, they remain eligible for the 
scholarship.  

To apply for the scholarship, all applicants must complete a Bob Warke – Dale Horn Scholarship 
Application. Scholarship applications are available on the HPPA website - www.hokeypark.com or 
by contacting Bill Sabol (HPPA Secretary) at (610) 844-7408 or secretary@hokeypark.com. All 
completed applications must be forwarded to the HPPA mailing address listed below by February 
29th 2024. Any applications received after this date will not be eligible for this annual scholarship.  

Mailing address 
 
HPPA  
Bob Warke – Dale Horn Scholarship  
P.O. Box 84  
Whitehall, PA 18052  

Scholarship Criteria  

Criteria for scholarship selection include high school academic performance, extracurricular 
activities and community service. The HPPA reserves the right to confirm any academic 
information listed on the application.  

Judging the Applications  

HPPA members with voting privileges will review all of the applications at the March/April meeting 
and vote for one girl and one boy to receive the $1,000 scholarships. Winners will be notified and 
receive their award after the voting has taken place. 

If you have any questions concerning applying for the Bob Warke – Dale Horn Scholarship, 
contact Bill Sabol at (610) 844-7408 or secretary@hokeypark.com.  
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The Hokendauqua Park and Playground Association 

Bob Warke – Dale Horn Scholarship Application - 2024 

Name:  

Address:  

City: State: Zip Code:  

Phone Number:  

Email address:  

Date of Birth:  

Sex:  

University, College or Trade School you will attend or are attending in the fall:  
   

Years you participated in the HPPA sports program:  
   

Sport(s) you played for the HPPA:  
   

List the names of all your HPPA coaches:  

 

 

   

Academic Information: (The HPPA reserves the right to verify this information with your high school 

guidance counselor).  

Current High School GPA:     Current High School Class Rank:  

 

List any academic honors and awards that you have received:  
   

   

   

   

   

   

 



  Extracurricular Activities  

List all of the extracurricular activities that you participated in throughout your high school years. Also list 

the dates (MM/YY) of your participation. Include both high school sponsored and non-high school 

sponsored activities. List any awards that you have won or offices that you held.  
   

   

   

   

   

   

   

   

 

   

   

   

   

   

Community Service  

List all of your community service activities; the timeframe of your participation and any awards you won 

or offices you held.  
   

   

 

   

   

     

   

   

 

 

   

 

 

Signature of Applicant: ____________________________________________  Date: __________  

Parent or Guardian Signature: _______________________________________  Date: __________ 

If necessary, you may attach additional pages of information.  


